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Introduction 5 

REVOLUTION '76 simulates the American struggle for inde­
pendence. Beginning with the convocation of the Second 
Continental Congress, it puts you in control of the new na­
tion's entire war effort, from organizing the new govern­
ment to raising taxes, from recruiting the armies to maneu­
vering them around the country. While playing, you will 
be exposed to the whole spectrum of problems that con­
fronted our Founding Fathers. What could be a greater 
challenge than to tackle the tasks that made these mighty 
figures legends? Whether you play for the strategic chal­
lenge or for historical insight, REVOLUTION '76 is sure to 
knock your socks off. 



6 Getting Started 

Quick Start Instructions: 

• Start the game using disk 1 . 

• You'll be required to know the right password to start the 
revolt. You'll be asked to select the right word from either 
the Historical Perspective or the Player's Reference. If you en­
ter an incorrect answer REVOLUTION '76 will return you to 
the real world immediately after the Boston Tea Party. 

• After Washington crosses the Delaware and the Boston 
Tea Party has taken place, click on the "OK" box in the 
lower right-hand corner of the screen and the first game 
screen will appear. 

• Advance from phase to phase by clicking on the "Go On" 
button. 

If you have questions, skim through the Game Basics sec­
tion. Have fun . 
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START-UP INSTRUCTIONS 
REVOLUTION '76 has been designed to run on a variety of 
Apple IIgs system. Different configurations involve differ­
ences in setting up and running the simulation. 

REVOLUTION '76 will run on systems with one of two pos­
sible memory configurations and three possible disk drive 
configurations. 

MEMORY CONFIGURATIONS AND SOUNDS 
The size of memory your machine has does not impact 
how you load or play the game, but it does have an impor­
tant effect you should know about: if you have 768K or less 
of memory, you will not hear the music and sound effects. 

DISK DRIVE CONFIGURATIONS AND START-UP 
PROCEDURES 
Whether you have one floppy drive, two floppy drives, or a 
hard drive will affect how you start the game. 

ONE FLOPPY DRIVE 

1. Insert Disk 1 into the drive. 

2. Turn on the system (or re-boot using the Apple-Control­
Reset keys, as described in your Apple IIGS Owner's Guide). 

3. Swap Disks 1 and 2 as prompted during the load se­
quence (this should happen just once before the title se­
quence and twice after it). 

4. While you can play REVOLUTION '76 with the music 
and sound effects on a one drive system (assuming you 
have sufficient RAM), this will involve a considerable 
amount of disk-swapping throughout the game. Therefore, 
we strongly recommend that you turn off the sounds as 
soon as you begin the game (once you get to the" Assign 
Leaders" screen). To turn off the sounds, simply pull down 
the "Game" menu and select the "Sound" option. This will 
toggle the sounds off. 
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8 Getting Started 

s. Once you have begun play, Disk 2 should be in the drive 
and, so long as you turn off the sounds, you will not need 
to swap disks again, unless you save the game. 

6. If you do save the game, you will be prompted to replace 
Disk 2 with Disk 3. After the save, you will be prompted to 
return Disk 2 to the drive. 

TWO FLOPPY DRIVES 

1. Insert Disk 1 into Drive 1. 

2. Insert Disk 2 into Drive 2. 

3. Turn on the system (or re-boot using the Apple-Control­
Reset keys, as described in you Apple IIGS Owner's Guide). 

4. After you are into the game and have finished assigning 
leaders you will be prompted to insert Disk 3. To do so, re­
move Disk 1 from Drive 1 and put Disk 3 in its place. From 
this point on, you will not have to switch disks again. 

S. NOTE: If you happen to have three or more disk drives, 
you can put all three disks in at the beginning and never 
have to swap. Just make sure that Disk 1 is in Drive 1. 

HARD DISK 

To play REVOLUTION '76 from a hard drive, you must first 
copy the necessary files from the floppy disks onto your 
hard disk. Follow steps 1 through 7 below to do this. You 
need do this only once. Step 8 tells you how to begin the 
program once installed. 

1. Boot the system. 

2. While in the Finder, create a folder with any appropriate 
name ("REV76" or whatever). This folder can be nested 
within other folders ("GreatGames," for instance). 

3. Place Disk 1 in a floppy drive and copy the 
"REV76.SYS16" application file into the folder you have 
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created for the game ("REV76" or whatever). If you are un­
certain how to copy files from one disk to another on the 
Apple IIGS, refer to your Owner's Guide. 

4. Now comes the tricky part. Open the "SYSTEM" folder 
on the floppy disk (Rev76.1), and then open the "FONTS" 
folder inside that. You should see a file called "SMALL­
VILLE.8" Now open the "SYSTEM" folder on your hard 
disk. You should see a folder called "FONTS" there. Copy 
the folder "SMALLVILLE.8" into this folder. Close the 
"FONTS" folder on Disk 1 (Rev76.1) and the "SYSTEM" 
folders on both the floppy disk and your hard disk. Phew! 

5. Remove Disk 1 from the floppy drive and insert Disk 2. 
Copy both folders ("PIX" and "INTRO") into your game 
folder (REV76 or whatever). 

6. Remove Disk 2 from the floppy drive and insert Disk 3. 
Copy both folders ("SOUNDS" and "SA VEDGAME") into 
your game folder. 

7. The game is now installed and ready to play. 

8. To begin: just launch REVOLUTION '76 as you would 
any other application on your hard drive, by double­
clicking the icon "REV76.SYS16." 

9. NOTES: There are a few things to remember about hard 
disk installation: 

a. REVOLUTION '76 can be nested in as many layers of 
folders on your hard disk as you want. BUT, all folders 
(REV76.SYS16, PIX, INTRO, and SOUNDS) must be at the 
same level of nesting, and within the same folder. 
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b. The font file "SMALLVILLE.8" must be installed in the 
"SYSTEM" folder of the boot volume (disk). Ordinarily this will 
be the hard disk itself. 
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The colonies have made their decision: the people want in­
dependence from England! Down with taxes and duties! No 
more restrictions imposed by Parliament! And the colonists 
have chosen you to orchestrate the rebellion. What terms 
will you request from the Crown? How will you fund your 
campaigns? How will you treat the loyalists in America? 

REVOLUTION '76 puts you in control of the many details 
of acquiring freedom and creating the United States. The 
following descriptions explain how to execute your poliCies 
and decisions. 

Each tum of REVOLUTION '76 represents the passage of 
one year. During the course of a turn you will set policies, 
recruit military support, negotiate alliances and more in a 
series of phases. The game proceeds as a series of turns un­
til, at the end of a turn, the end of game conditions have 
been fulfilled, at which point the program will terminate 
play and announce the winner. 

Phases: The phases of a turn encompass the major areas of 
activity in governing revolutionary America. Each phase is 
associated with one or two screens, through which the 
player issues instructions to the revolutionary government. 
The screens are discussed in detail in the Game Reference 
Section. They are, in sequence: 
1. Organize Government 4. Supply 
2. Administer S. Campaign 
3. Recruit 6. Diplomacy 

Advancing from Phase to Phase: Once you have is­
sued all the instructions you wish, simply click on the "Go 
On l! button. In some cases the program will give you a 
chance to reconsider your decisions, but most of the time it 
will not. Be sure you have issued all instructions you want 
before you go on to the next screen. The fate of the repub­
lic could depend on it! 

Advancing from Turn to Turn (Year to Year): Each 
turn of the game represents the passage of one year: the 
game begins in 1775. When you end the Diplomacy phase, 
the program will check if the End of Game conditions have 
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been fulfilled. If the proper conditions have not been met, 
a progress report will appear and the game will announce 
the beginning of a new year. There is no set ending, but 
because of the inherent limitations of the combatants a vic­
tor will generally emerge within about ten years. 

Ending a game: If the end of game conditions have been 
met, REVOLUTION '76 will determine which side has won 
and what level of victory it achieved. The game can either 
end in military victory for the British or the Americans, or 
in a negotiated settlement. 

Issuing Commands: Play of REVOLUTION '76 centers on 
a series of screens that allow you to issue all of the neces­
sary instructions to the rebellious Americans. Each screen is 
concerned with a specific function of government. On each 
screen are icons which symbolize a particular choice. To 
implement a decision, just click on the person or place af­
fected by the decision and then click on the icon symboliz­
ing the decision. The icon will appear next to or, in some 
cases, on top of, the person or place affected. At a glance 
you will be able to tell who your committee chairmen are, 
what your military recruitment and privateer poliCies are, 
who your ambassadors are and what terms they're negotiat­
ing for, and so on. 

Accessing Information: The menu item at the top right 
corner of the screen, Info, allows you to obtain information 
on the American Government; Regions; States and Cities; 
Foreign Countries; the British and American Armies (by re­
gion and by city); American Generals and Politicians; and 
British Generals. Information can also be accessed with but­
tons on some screens. 

As play moves from one phase to the next, you will be pre­
sented with a variety of messages about the progress of the 
revolution. They will be in one of the following four forms: 

Prompts: Prompts are messages to the player from some 
important figure or faction in the revolution suggesting a 
course of action be taken during the following phase. The 
prompts are not disinterested hints from the program, nor 
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Prompt 
Screen 

Game Basics 

do they indicate what is necessarily the best course of ac­
tion for the revolutionary government. Instead, they are in­
dications that at least one faction in the revolutionary 
cause has a strong interest in a particular course of action. 

Following a prompt will not necessarily lead towards victo­
ry, but ignoring a prompt will certainly have a political 
cost, since the prompting party will be alienated from your 
government by your refusal to follow its wishes. On the 

other hand, following a prompt may alienate another fac­
tion of revolutionaries, regardless of whether it contributes 
to the revolutionary cause. This alienation will be reflected 
in lowered patriotism, as reflected in the Regional Informa­
tion Charts. 

Warnings: Warnings are the opposite of prompts. They 
indicate that a particular party in the revolutionary coali­
tion opposes a proposed course of action. As with prompts, 
the warning does not necessarily reflect the best interests of 
the revolutionary cause as a whole; it simply makes clear 
the interests of one faction of it. Following the warning 
mayor may not help the revolution, but not following it 
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will certainly alienate the group issuing it. As with 
prompts, political alienation will be reflected in the level of 
patriotism shown in the Regional Information Charts. 

Results: Results are impartial reports on the consequences 
of actions taken during a phase. They are impartial, in con­
trast to the prompts and warnings, since they objectively 
report the results of a phase rather than filtering the report 
through some factional viewpoint. 

Updates: Updates convey information about develop­
ments beyond the scope of the game: events in distant the­
aters of the war, long-term or autonomous developments at 
home, actions initiated by the British or Tories, and the 
like. They, like the result reports, are impartial in compari­
son with prompts and warnings. 

Above the game screen is a menu bar which shows two 
items: Game and Info. For more details on the Info menu, 
check the Game Reference Section. 

13 



14 Game Basics 

Game: If you do not wish to hear the music and sound ef­
fects, select the SOUND option on the Game menu. This 
will de-activate the sound. Simply choose that option again 
to re-activate it. Note: If your system has only 768K of 
RAM, the sounds will not play at all. Note also that if your 
system is a one floppy drive system, we recommend that 
you toggle the sounds off at the beginning of play. 

To save the current game to disk choose SAVE. Note that 
only one game can be saved per disk. This will allow you to 
save and restart a game as you play. If you want to save 
more than one game, just transfer the current game out of 
the "Saved Game" folder on Disk 3 to another folder before 
launching the game. Then, before you resume play, decide 
which old game you want to use and make sure its files are 
in the "Saved Game" folder. 

To end the current game choose SURRENDER. The control 
of the computer will return to the operating system. 
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Game Reference Section 15 

The short introduction should have given you enough or­
ientation to walk through the game and learn it by playing 
it. However, REVOLUTION '76 is a complex and subtle 
game, and while you play, you will find it helpful to refer 
to the Game Reference Section if you are uncertain about 
the meaning or implications of some aspect of play. You 

Goal' ORGANIZE GOVERNMENT Info 

(Refor m Economy ) 

~ 
~ 
(c on f ~del ate) 

(A SSIgn leadel S) 

will find the reference section arranged according to the se­
quence of phases, so issues are addressed at the point at 
which they are most likely to appear in the game. Follow­
ing the section on phases is a similar listing of the terms 
you will encounter in the information displays available 
through the Info menu. 

Organize Government 

You organize the new Federal government. At various 
times, you will assign leaders to administrative pOSitions, 
declare independence from Britain, propose Articles of 
Confederation to give the new government permanent 
structures, organize an executive branch to better carry out 
the federal government's affairs, and regulate the economy 
to cope with wartime inflation. 
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Assign 
Leaders 

Game Reference Section 

During the first phase of each turn you have the chance to 
organize the continental government. In all turns except 
the first the Organization Phase begins by presenting you 
with a screen depicting the available options: Assign Lead­
ers, Declare Independence, Confederate, Create Executive, 
and Reform Economy. On the first turn you will go directly 
to the Assign Leaders screen (see below). In most cases, se­
lection of an option will cause a new screen to come up. In 
one case, Declare Independence, selecting the option and 
issuing the instruction will simply register the decision and 
move you to the next phase. Choosing the Create Execu­
tive option causes the Assign Leaders screen to come up. 
Each of the following major categories represents an op­
tion. To select one, just click on it. 

ASSIGN LEADERS: Selecting this option brings up a 
screen allowing you to make four assignments from among 
twelve revolutionaries. 

Info 

These men have regional and factional allegiances as well 
as administrative and negotiating talents. Factional alle­
giance is indicated by the script a name is in: a sensible, up­
right script for moderates, a more florid and fancy script for 
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radicals. Regional origins are indicated by the color of the 
box surrounding each name: green and red for Southerners, 
yellow and red for those from the Mid-Atlantic, two shades 
of red for New Englanders (note the KEY at the bottom of 
the screen). This information is important in determining 
the political implications of your appointments, since you 
will want to strike a balance between moderates and radi­
cals and between New Englanders, Southerners and repre­
sentatives from the Mid-Atlantic. 

In addition, each man is rated on his administrative and 
negotiating skills. To obtain this information, click on the 
circle at the upper left corner of a portrait, then click on the 
Info button at the bottom of the screen (this information is 
also available through the Info menu). These talents, partic­
ularly administrative talent, will contribute to activities un­
dertaken by each branch of government. If the govern­
ment's organization level is Congress or Confederation, the 
leader is considered to be the Chairman of the appropriate 
Congressional Committee. If the organization level is Exec­
utive, he is considered to be the Secretary of the appropri­
ate department. The four positions are: 

• Finance: Finance is concerned primarily with raising 
money for the treasury. The stronger the head of the finan­
cial administration's administrative talent, the more taxes 
will actually be raised for a given level of taxation. Further­
more, if the continental government does not have the 
power of taxation itself, the stronger the leader's negotiat­
ing talent, the higher the level of taxation the different re­
gions are likely to agree to. 

• Foreign Affairs: The leader of the foreign affairs commit­
tee/department contributes his administrative talent to any 
negotiations with foreign powers for alliance and to talks 
with Britain for peace terms. 

• War: The administrator of this department contributes 
his talents to both recruiting new soldiers and raising sup­
plies. His abilities affect both the costs and the results of 
these activities. 

17 
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• Navy: The chairman/secretary of this department contrib­
utes his administrative talents to both building new ships 
and conducting naval operations. His abilities affect the 
amount of the country's naval construction capacity that is 
actually used at a given level of building, the costs of build­
ing new ships, and the overall performance of the nation's 
navy at sea. 

DECLARE INDEPENDENCE: Selecting this option will 
cause the Congress to formally declare the independence of 
the American colonies from Britain. The advantages of this 
act are that the European powers will not openly back the 
revolutionaries until they take this step, and few Americans 
will accept further attempts to organize the government so 
long as the Americans are still formally colonies of Britain. 
The disadvantage of a declaration of independence is that if 
it comes too soon, it will alienate moderate patriots from 
the revolutionary cause. On the other hand, a well-timed 
declaration of independence will boost patriotism through­
out the land. 

CONFEDERATE: Selecting this option causes a screen to 
come up through which you can propose the terms upon 
which a permanent union of the thirteen states will be 
based. 

The advantages of confederation are that European powers 
will take American diplomats more seriously, patriotism 
will be bolstered by the show of unity, and, if the terms are 
right, your powers as the central government will be en­
hanced. The disadvantage of confederation is that if it is 
done too soon, moderates will be alienated from the patriot 
cause. 

In forging a confederation, the more states approve it, the 
more powerful it will be. To improve your support, you will 
be given one chance per turn to revise your terms and try 
to win over the holdouts. Keep in mind that if an entire re­
gion rejects your terms, even if you muster a majority 
among the other states, patriotism in the holdout region 
will plummet, which could have very serious consequences 
for the revolutionary cause. 
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When you choose to confederate, you must take a position 
on each of the following four issues: 

• Taxation: Whether the continental government has the 
power to levy taxes itself, or can merely request that the 
states use their power to tax to raise a specified amount as a 
contribution. The choices are: 

Federal Taxes: The advantage of federal taxation is that it 
increases the freedom of action of the continental govern­
ment, since it can depend on a certain amount of money 
coming in each year, and can change that level quickly and 
efficiently. The disadvantage is that the state governments 
uniformly oppose it. The opposite is true of the state subsi­
dy method. 

State Subsidies: The advantages and disadvantages of this 
method of revenue-raising are the opposite of those of fed­
eral taxation: the states love it, but it makes it hard for the 
federal government to know how much revenue is coming 
in during a given year. 

• Representation: Whether states will be represented in 
Congress according to the size of their population, by an 
equal number of delegates regardless of size, or by a two­
house Congress. 

Proportional: This option specifies that the states will 
have a number of votes in Congress that reflects the size of 
the state's population relative to the other states. Big states 
will obviously favor this option. 

By State: This option specifies that each state will have an 
equal vote in Congress, regardless of its size. This is the fa­
vorite option of the small states. 

Bicameral: This option specifies that Congress will consist 
of two houses, one in which representation reflects size and 
one in which representation is equal. This represents a 
compromise, which will either please both parties or alien­
ate them. 

19 
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• Western Lands: Whether the claims by different states to 
territories west of the Appalachian Mountains will be recog­
nized, or those lands will be considered federal territories. 

Federal Control: This option puts land west of the Appa­
lachian Mountains under continental jurisdiction. The ad­
vantages of federal ownership are that it will keep the states 
from becoming even more disproportionate in land and 
population, and that eventually the land can be sold to 
raise money for the central government. The disadvantage 
of federal ownership is that it will alienate those states with 
claims, especially those with large ones. States without 
claims favor this approach. 

State Ownership: This option recognizes the legitimacy 
of state claims to western lands, although the various over­
lapping boundaries will have to be reconciled. 

• Slaves: How slave populations will be counted in deter­
mining tax levies and, if appropriate, representation to 
Congress. This issue pits slave states, who want them 
counted fully (although they have no political rights with­
in the states), against non-slave states, which do not want 
to see them counted at all. Because of the structure of their 
economies, this issue basically pOSitions the southern 
states, the Carolinas and the Chesapeake, against the north­
ern states, in the middle region and New England. The 
compromise of counting the slaves partially has worked be­
fore, but like all compromises it could backfire and alienate 
both parties. Your choices are: 

Not Counted: This option specifies that the slaves will not 
be considered in determining the size of a state's popula­
tion. 

Counted: This option specifies that slaves will be fully 
counted in any census. 

Partially Counted: This option specifies that five slaves 
will be equal to three freemen in calculating a state's politi­
cal weight. 
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CREATE EXECUTIVE: Selecting this option closes the 
Organize Government screen and registers the decision to 
create an executive branch of government. The program 
will display any reaction to the decision and, if you stick 
with it, will open the Assign Leaders screen so you can reas­
sign positions if you wish. The reason you may not want to 
go ahead with creating an executive is that if the condi­
tions are not right radical leaders will oppose it as a danger­
ous move toward tyranny. Before selecting this option, you 
should consider what organizational measures might reas­
sure the radical revolutionaries that any national executive 
will be bound to a mutually-acceptable structure of govern­
ment. The advantage of an executive level of governmental 
organization is that foreign countries will be even more im­
pressed with the viability of the revolutionary cause, and 
the government itself will be able to administer the country 
more efficiently. 

REFORM ECONOMY: Selecting this option will close the 
Organize Government screen and display a screen which al­
lows you to attempt measures to reduce inflation of the 
currency if this seems to be getting out of hand. 

Inflation is the process by which continental money loses 
value, becoming a fraction of its face value. Inflation oc­
curs if the revolutionary government spends more to run 
the war effort than it receives in taxes. If this happens, the 
Treasury must print additional money to make up the dif­
ference . As this money enters circulation, it does not really 
create new wealth; it simply increases the number of dol­
lars available to bid for the real wealth that does exist. 
When more dollars are available to pay for the same 
amount of goods and services, the amount of goods and 
services each dollar will buy decreases. Because of a short­
age of currency before the revolution, this process will not 
be apparent the first year, but once it starts, you'll know it! 

This process can be interrupted by taxing the dollars out of 
circulation, but this may not work, for once inflation gets 
under way, it becomes very difficult to stop. The reason for 
this is that people begin to assume that inflation will con­
tinue, and anticipate it by raising prices for things they sell. 
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"Demand-pull" inflation thus becomes "cost-push" infla­
tion. The reforms you can adopt are increasingly powerful, 
but also increasingly unpleasant to the population at large. 
Therefore, if the reform is stronger than the current eco­
nomic situation needs, the government will suffer political­
ly for the unnecessary discomfort caused. On the other 
hand, if the chosen reform is too mild, it will not cure the 
disease. You must therefore walk a tightrope when attempt­
ing to fix the economy. Enact your reform by clicking on 
the name of the policy. The economic reform options are: 

Punish Profiteers: The government attempts to identify 
and punish those merchants who are deliberately contrib­
uting to inflation by hiking their prices faster than the 
overall rate of inflation so that they can profit from it rath­
er than lose to it. The move is politically popular but eco­
nomically questionable, since the underlying causes of in­
flation go much deeper. It is useful against a slight rise in 
prices, but ineffectual against anything more. 

Price Controls: The most direct response to inflation, 
price controls mandate that vendors sell their products at a 
stipulated, fixed price. Unfortunately, this approach 
doesn't really address the underlying causes of inflation ei­
ther, therefore the price controls become harder and harder 
to maintain. Price controls are useful against a mild infla­
tion, but are ineffectual against a strong inflation and, be­
cause of the hardships they impose, are politically damag­
ing if imposed unnecessarily. 

Reform Currency: Reforming the currency means replac­
ing the old form of money with a new one and exchanging 
old for new at a fixed rate. It is an open admission that the 
old currency is collapsing, and because the exchange rate is 
likely to overvalue the old currency, amounts to a partial 
repudiation of debt. It is useful against a strong inflation, 
but very damaging politically if invoked unnecessarily. 

Repudiate Debt: The strongest medicine of all, this is also 
the most bitter. What it amounts to is admitting to the citi­
zens that their money is worthless, and telling bondholders 
that their investment has gone bust. A crisis measure of last 
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resort, repudiating the debt often happens just before los­
ing the game. However, it may be the only chance of survi­
val. The player should be sure that it is necessary before 
choosing it, for the medicine may be more dangerous than 
the malady. 

Administer 
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You administer the separate affairs of the rebellious colo­
nies, in particular taxation and their policy toward the in­
habitants who favor the British, the Tories. Because of the 
tedium that would result from administering thirteen sep­
arate governments, they have been consolidated into four 
geographic regions which are governed collectively. The re­
gions are based not only on geography, but also on eco­
nomics and, to some extent, social and political characteris­
tics as well. 

TftKRIITE 
$S$S e Crisis) 
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In the second phase of the turn, you set the tax rates and 
the policies toward loyalists for each of the regions that the 
revolutionaries control. This is done by clicking on the cir­
cle next to the region (a black dot will appear in the circle) 
and then clicking on the name of the desired tax and Tory 
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policies. An icon symbolizing each choice will appear next 
to the region. There is also an additional icon, not directly 
under the player's control, which indicates areas of Tory 
unrest. This information comes in handy when you are de­
ciding on your Tory policies. 

TAX RATES: Taxes are the government's primary source 
of money. Unfortunately, the colonists rebelled against 
Britain in large measure because of taxes, and they are 
therefore unlikely to welcome heavy taxes by the continen­
tal government either. The actual amounts received from 
taxation will vary considerably according the the influence 
of a number of factors . Unless the Articles of Confederation 
stipulate that the federal government can levy taxes on its 
own, the regions will not necessarily contribute at the re­
quested rate. Their level of contribution will reflect the lev­
el of patriotism in the region, the level of taxes it is accus­
tomed to paying, and the negotiating skill of the leader 
you've placed in charge of finances. The specific amount re­
turned, given a specified tax rate on a given tax base will 
vary as well, reflecting the administrative talent of the Fi­
nance Committee Chair or Secretary of the Treasury. 
The rate options are: 

Crisis: The region will contribute more than 10% of its tax 
base to the continental government. 

Heavy: The region will contribute between S% and 10% of 
its tax base to the continental cause. 

Moderate: The region will contribute between 1% and S% 
of its tax base to the continental treasury. 

Light: The region will contribute less than 1% of its tax 
base to the continental coffers. 

TORY POLICY: Tory policy is the approach to the prob­
lem of loyalist citizens taken by the state governments in a 
region over the course of the year. These range from at­
tempts to win them over or at least gain their neutrality 
through generous treatment, to harsh mob actions like tar­
ring and feathering them or driving them off their land. 
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The efficacy of these policies will vary according to the bal­
ance of sympathies within the region. Where the patriots 
are relatively weak, they are ill-advised to press the loyalists 
too strongly. Where the patriots are relatively strong, they 
can afford to take a high hand. If you choose your Tory 
policies wisely, they can dampen the spirit of loyalism and 
hearten that of patriotism. On the other hand, if the poli­
cies chosen are too harsh or too mild for the circumstances, 
loyalism will surge either from confidence or anger, and pa­
triotism will languish. The policy choices are: 

Persecute: The government will use all means at its dispo­
sal, both legal and extra-legal, to hurt loyalists in the area. 

Prosecute: The government will use all legal means to ha­
rass loyalists, and will give patriots grudging redress for 
popular actions against the Tories. 

Tolerate: The government will not seek to discomfort loy­
alists, and will uphold the laws protecting them from ille­
gal harassment. 

Conciliate: The government will promote cooperation 
and reconciliation between patriots and loyalists, minimiz­
ing their differences and discouraging popular actions. 

Recruit 

After you "Go On" past the Administer phase, the game 
moves into the Recruit phase. During this phase, you will 
attempt to raise new forces to defend the revolution. You 
will set recruitment policies for each region, balancing the 
manpower needs of the state militias, the continental 
army, and the independent privateering ships that raided 
England's vital shipping lanes. 

PRIVATEERS: The first type of recruitment you must con­
sider is privateers, ships that put to sea to undertake a form 
of legitimized piracy against British vessels. Because these 
ships must harbor at established ports, information about 
privateering in any particular region is contained on the in­
formation displays about the cities of that region. Privateers 
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have two primary effects on the course of the game. In the 
first place, they can diminish the British will to fight. Brit­
ain is a maritime empire dependent on sea transport both 
for its commercial life and for its military power. While the 
Royal Navy can safeguard the supply lines of the armies in 
America from the privateers, it cannot protect all British 
merchant ships everywhere. As British ship losses mount, 
insurance rates climb, and the less enthusiasm the impor­
tant merchant and financial communities, and the mem­
bers of Parliament who represent them, will show for the 
war. In other words, as British shipping declines, so does 
the government's majority. In the second place, privateers 
can be a boon to the continental economy. Each merchant 
prize captured by the privateers brings wealth to the conti­
nental cause as well as to the privateers themselves. 

Privateers are very cheap for the government in money; in 
fact, they cost nothing and actually return a profit! Howev­
er, they do have another, serious cost: they siphon away 
manpower from the militia and army. Because privateering 
is safer and more profitable than service on land, it is all 
too easy to raise privateers. The problem comes when the 
recruiting officers try to fill the other ranks . In order to con-
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trol, or at least influence, the flow of manpower into priva­
teering, you should set a privateer policy for each region 
that will fit in with your other recruiting goals. The success 
of privateering reflects the number of privateers, the level 
of diplomatic support for the revolution (which opens up 
bases and sources of supply), and the administrative talent 
of the naval administration. The options are: 

Discourage: The government's attitude toward privateers 
will be vaguely hostile, denying letters of marque authoriz­
ing it where politically possible, and placing administrative 
obstacles in the way of recruiting crews and supplying 
ships. These measures will hardly stop privateering activity, 
but they will cause fewer men to be drawn into it. 

Accept: The government will not attempt to block priva­
teering activities, but it will not do anything to promote 
them either. 

Encourage: The government will seek to facilitate private 
initiatives to raise crews and outfit ships. This policy will 
insure a large number of privateers will be operating from 
this region. 
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Sponsor: The government will actually organize privateer­
ing expeditions, providing some minor funds and much ad­
ministrative support. These efforts will result in the maxi­
mum number of ships possible putting to sea as privateers. 

MILITIA: The next type of force whose level you must 
consider is the militia, part time soldiers available for limit­
ed duty within the region. They are relatively cheap since 
the states, not the continental government, pay for them, 
but their military usefulness is limited to defense of the 
area in which they are raised. Militia have only half the 
combat value of regular troops and they cannot be moved 
from one area to another. Also, to some extent militia re­
cruitment Siphons manpower that would otherwise be 
available for duty with the regular army. The actual num­
bers of men mobilized for a given population and a given 
mobilization level will vary according to the level of patri­
otism in the region, the level of privateering in the region, 
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the reputation of the American military, and the proximity 
of British troops. 

You can mobilize the militia forces to the following levels: 

Minimal: Only a small effort will be put into the militia 
forces, so only a few thousand men at most will be availa­
ble if the region or its cities are invaded. 

Limited: A somewhat more concerted effort will be made 
to raise and maintain militia, although the total numbers 
will still be small. 

Extensive: A more formidable militia force will be main­
tained, although not all the region is capable of. 

General: A total mobilization of militia eligible men will 
be undertaken, so that the region will have its maximum 
number of defenders. 

REGULARS: The regulars are full-fledged soldiers, the core 
armies of the revolutionary forces. Regulars can be used 
both to defend and to attack. They can move with a gener­
al from one area to another, either to reinforce its defense 
or to seize it from British control. They are stronger in both 
attack and defense than the militia. The continental gov­
ernment must pay both to raise and supply regulars. The 
cost of recruitment depends on the level of patriotism in 
the region, the population, the recruitment strategy chosen 
by the player, and the administrative talent of the Chair­
man of the Army Committee or Secretary of War. 

You can set each region's recruitment poliCies to one of 
four levels. These levels differ both in the degree of empha­
sis being placed on recruitment and the approach being 
taken to garner new recruits. 

Routine: Recruitment officers will tour the region offering 
normal inducements of pay, prestige, and adventure. It can 
be expected to yield a modest crop of cannon fodder, but 
will not be too costly either. 
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Bonuses: New recruits will be offered significant rewards 
for enlisting, either cash payments or land grants. This is 
an expensive way to gain extra recruits, but it leaves every­
one involved fairly happy. 

Quotas: Recruitment goals will be mandated to local com­
munities, which will then be left to fill them as they can. 
This is a cheaper way of gaining extra recruits, but it tends 
to wear down a region's patriotism. 
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Combined: Both quotas and bonuses will be utilized to ob­
tain the maximum number of recruits possible. This ap­
proach is costly both financially and militarily, but does 
bring in every man who can be got. 

Supply 

In REVOLUTION '76 the drab but vital activity of supply­
ing armed forces with weapons, ammunition, food, cloth­
ing, and the hundreds of other items needed by thousands 
of fighting men has been reduced to two basic questions: 
what level of material support will be provided to the conti­
nental forces, and what level of shipbuilding will supply 
vessels to the continental navy. During this phase you will 
set the supply level for the continental forces, and also set 
the building program for the incipient continental navy. 

ARMY SUPPLY: An army, even a revolutionary army, 
marches on its stomach. The level of supply has a tremen­
dous effect on the army's ability and willingness to fight. 
When American forces meet the British in battle, the Amer­
ican supply level is an important consideration in deter­
mining the victor. 

If the army is poorly supplied, its morale will suffer. If mo­
rale falls too low due to prolonged deprivation, you may 
have a mutiny on your hands. Keep in mind, however, that 
supplying the army is one of the biggest expenses of the 
continental government. And the costs increase geometri­
cally, rather than arithmetically, as higher levels are main­
tained. Also, because some military supplies require special­
ized manufacture, while others are controlled by 
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manufacturers who will not accept paper money, the conti­
nental government may not be able to maintain a high lev­
el of supply even if it is willing to spend the money. In gen­
eral, the higher the desired level of supply, the stronger the 
support of the European powers must be in order to 
achieve it. The supply levels are: 

Replete: The continental government is providing every­
thing the army might desire, both a high level of material 
comfort and a surfeit of weapons and ammunition. Morale 
should be excellent and combat effectiveness very high. 

Suffident: The continental government is providing all 
the supplies the army really needs. Morale should be good 
and combat effectiveness fine. 

Significant: The continental government is filling much 
of the army's needs, although a certain amount must be ob­
tained through purely local activities. The morale and effec­
tiveness of the army will still be degraded, but the worst 
danger of mutiny among the soldiery will be avoided. 

Minimal: The continental government is providing the 
bare minimum needed to keep the army going. The men 
must forage lOr anything beyond this. If this is the supply 
level, the morale and combat effectiveness of the army will 
be poor and the possibility of a mutiny real. 

NAVY BUILDING: While the Americans cannot possibly 
construct a navy capable of challenging the scores of Brit­
ish ships of the line that rule the waves, they can create a 
fleet of nimble frigates to harass the Royal Navy and under­
mine the international merchants' support for the war. 
Frigates are used mainly as a kind of heavy privateer. Aimed 
principally at commercial shipping, they are also capable of 
challenging the British warships that patrol the high seas to 
suppress the swarms of merchantmen-turned-privateers. 

Ships, even frigates, are expensive. The vessels are costly 
and the cannons carried on each could equip several regi­
ments. Even a modest building program will cost the revo­
lutionary treasury sorely, and an all-out effort will probably 
create the government's largest single expense. Once the 
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ships are built, they must still be maintained, a smaller but 
by no means insignificant outlay. 

Naval construction requi res both special expertise and spe­
cialized facilities that cannot be created overnight. Each 
port has a limit to the number of warships that can be con­
structed there at a time, and this is the maximum amount 
of ships that can be built in a year. A program of this mag­
nitude presents significant administrative challenges, so 
the number of ships constructed will vary somewhat ac­
cording to the administrative talent of the Chairman of the 
Navy Committee. 

Naval vessels, like naval yards, cannot be built in a day; in 
fact, it takes a full year for ships to be built in the game, 
and will be reported at the beginning of the Supply phase. 
The following year. The building levels are: 

Maximum: The continental navy will increase as much as 
the dockyards can sustain. The next year will see a substan­
tial rise in the number of friga tes at sea. 

Minimum: The Americans will utilize about one-third of 
the total shipbuilding capacity. This should at least replace 
any losses incurred over the next year, and may lead to 
some increase in the total number of frigates at sea. 

No Building: The government will neither build nor retire 
ships. The only costs will be those of outfitting existing 
ships for another year of service. 

Reduce Navy 1/3: The number of ships in service will be 
reduced by one-third. The primary reason for doing this is 
to reduce maintenance expenses. 

Set these policies in the same way as you enact your other 
choices: click on the circle next to the name of the policy. 

Campaign 

During the Campaign phase, you direct the strategic opera­
tions of the continental armies by dispatching generals to 
defend or attack areas. The map shows the five regiOns and 
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six cities, and the icons associated with each area tell you 
what type of force is present in each: a blue soldier indi­
cates the presence of American regulars, a red soldier means 
that the British army is in town (or in the region), a brown 
soldier stands for an American militia force, and a green 
soldier tells you that the local Tories have mobilized (note 
the KEY on right side of the screen). Furthermore, a march­
ing soldier tells you that troops have been ordered to move 
from the area, while a profile of a general tells you that a 
leader has been ordered to command the defense there. 

You'll need more information than the icons can give to 
make intelligent decisions, however. You'll need to know 
how many of each type of force is present, who the com­
manding officer is and how the morale of each side is hold­
ing up. There are two ways to find these out. One way is 
through the Armies display on the Info menu. A quicker 
way is to use the Origin and Destination information but­
tons. 

The "Origin" and "Destination" information buttons allow 
you quick access to information about places you're think­
ing of moving from or to. There are two circles associated 
with each location on the map. To specify an origin, click 
on the green circle on the left; to specify a destination, 
click on the red circle on the right. To find out about your 
origin or destination, click on the Origin or Destination in­
formation button in the lower right section of the screen. A 
display will appear which will show: 

GENERAL: Who the commanding officer is, if any. 

REGULARS: How many troops each side has stationed in 
the region or City. 

MILITIA/TORIES: How many local forces each side has. 
Remember, these fighters cannot move, and only count for 
half as much as the regular forces. ' 

MORALE: How each side's fighting spirit is holding up. 
The possible levels are: 
• Mutinous • Stolid 
• Low • High 
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SUPPLY (Americans only): The level of supply being 
provided to American forces. The possible levels are: 
• Minimal • Sufficient 
• Significant • Replete 

FORT: The value of a city's fortifications to whoever con­
trols it at the begionning of a campaign phase. Fortifica­
tions can boost a side's strength significanly. The levels of 
fortification are: 
• None • Major 
• Minor • World-class 

TRAINING (Americans only): The level of formal mili­
tary training the regulars have. This is a very important fac­
tor in battle: only fully-trained regulars are equal to the 
British in battle. The levels of training are: 
• None • Partial 
• Little • Full 

POTENTIAL MILITIA (Americans only): If the British 
control an area, this number indicates the size of the milita 
who will fight if American regulars move in. 

There are three other information buttons, located above 
Origin and Destination. Clicking on the Move information 
button gives you information about who is moving from 
the origin currently selected on the map (the green but­
ton). Clicking on the Defend information button gives you 
information about the general assigned to lead the defense 
of the destination selected on the map (the red button) . 
Clicking on the "Brits" information button gives informa­
tion about any British movement out of the destination 
currently selected on the map (the red button). 

Running the War 

Once you've sized up the situation the time will come to 
make your military decisions. You may find it necessary to 
move troops to an area under enemy attack, or you may 
want to simply assign a general to lead the defense of an 
area where troop strength is adequate. Although REVOLU­
TION '76 is more than just a war game, the fact remains 

33 



34 Game Reference Section 

that, no matter how cleverly you've designed your govern­
ment, you must win on the battlefield to win the game. 

MOVING &: DEFENDING 
To move troops, first specify their Origin, by selecting a 
green button on the map, and their Destination, by select­
ing a red button on the map. The destination cannot be 
more than one region away from the origin (you can move 
from and/or to cities within adjacent regions). You then use 
the buttons in the upper-righthand side of the screen to 
choose the number of troops you want to move. You can 
select the number in two ways: 

1. Select a general quantity, and let the computer deter­
mine the exact number. The general quantities are selected 
via the labelled buttons, and are: 
• A Few (about 25%) • Most (about 75%) 
• Some (about 50%) • All (100%) 

2. Select an exact number by pressing the "+" and "_" but­
tons. 

Whichever way you choose (you can combine them), the 
number of troops you are assigning will be displayed be­
tween the "+" and the "_" buttons. 

In general, troops will move wherE ordered, unless strong 
enemy forces block their path. Americans can move to any 
region that is adjacent to the region they are moving from 
if their destination is under American control. If a city is 
held by the Americans in a region held by the British, 
American troops cannot be moved there. But the converse 
is not true: if a region is held by the Americans, the British 
can move to a city within that region if that city is held by 
the British. Furthermore, because the British control the 
waters they can easily move out of a region by sea. The 
Americans will only be able to do this once they (or an ally) 
wrest control of the American waters from the British. 
When you're ready to go, click on the Move button. This 
will bring up a new screen through which you will assign a 
general to command your troops. 
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If you want to defend an area under attack, or just want to 
place a general in command of a region or city you already 
control, click on the red destination button of the area and 
then click on the Defend button. This will bring up the 
same screen that the Move button brings up. 

ASSIGN GENERALS 
This screen displays portraits of ten American generals, 
along with each one's potential new assignment and his 
current orders. There is also an Info button at the bottom 
of the screen which enables you to get the same informa­
tion that you can get through the Generals display on the 
Info menu: the man's home state, popularity, experience, 
generalship, leadership, and, if applicable, his current com­
mand, orders, origin, destination and the number of troops 
under him . Pick a general the same way you choose a poli­
tician: click on the circle in the upper left-hand corner of 
his portrait. To assign him, click on the Assign button at 
the bottom of the screen. 

A general who assumes command in a region as a result of 
a Move command will lend his generalship rating to any 
combat in that region during his command. He will also af­
fect attrition rates, morale and mutinies with his Leader­
ship rating. 

A general's presence is not necessary to defend an area, for 
the forces in an area will always defend themselves if the 
British move in. However, a general does add his general­
ship value to the defense, and his leadership will help hold 
the army together from year to year. Thus, it is a good idea 
to send a general to any important area in danger of a Brit­
ish attack. If a general is already in command of a region 
when another general is ordered in, the player will be asked 
to indicate which is to be the commander. 

As with politiCians, the regions of the country are very con­
scious of the balance of leadership in the continental army. 
Thus, you should consciously strive to maintain a balance 
of appointments between generals from New England, the 
Middle States, and the South (the Chesapeake and the Car­
olinas). If your appOintments are imbalanced in some way, 
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representatives from the slighted region may ask you to re­
vise your appointments. If you decide to do this, click on 
the YES box on the prompt screen. This will bring up the 
Campaign screen again. Consider your move carefully: re­
lieving a general of his command is a fairly serious move, 
and will antagonize both the general and his sectional sup­
porters. 

Note: If you want to cancel a general's orders go to the As­
sign Leaders screen (you can always get there by selecting 
an area to defend). Select the general whose orders you 
want to cancel. Click on the Cancel button. If you do not 
want to make an aSSignment, select a general who is unas­
signed and select Cancel. The program will take you back 
to the map. 

BATTLES 
When American and British troops, including regulars, mi­
litia, and/or Tories, occupy the same area after movement, 
combat ensues. Combat is affected by the number of troops 
on each side, the types of troops on each side, the general­
ship of each commander (if any), the morale of each army, 
and the American supply level. Battles have two results: 
troops are eliminated, and the survivors of one side or the 
other retreat. Battles usually result in losses on both sides, 
with the loser taking the greater losses and being forced to 
retreat. The losers will attempt to retreat to a friendly con­
trolled area but if none is available all the defeated troops 
are eliminated. Note that the rules governing retreats mean 
that generally the Americans must be able to retreat to an 
area in the same or in an adjacent region, without being 
blocked by intervening British, while the British can retreat 
by sea to any area they control. However, if the British lose 
control of American waters, the situation is reversed: the 
Americans can retreat anywhere, while the British can only 
retreat to an area they can reach overland. Note: since To­
ries and militia cannot move from their area of origin, they 
cannot retreat, but are entirely eliminated instead. 

CONTROL 
A side controls an area if it has troops remaining in it at the 
end of the campaign phase. The Americans must control a 
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region in order to administer it, raise troops in it, or oper­
ate in it. If the Americans control a region but not the city 
or cities in it, the economic and recruiting values of the re­
gion are reduced in proportion to the size of the cities' tax 
base and population. 

Either side can achieve a total military victory by gaining 
control of all areas. And in general, the British pOSition in 
peace negotiations will be affected by the balance of con­
trolled areas. The efficacy of American diplomatic efforts is 
affected by the number of regions the colonies hold. 

If the Americans are allied to a European country and that 
country's navy gains control of American waters, then 
American troops can move from any area to any other area 
during that turn. Note that unless a European country has 
gained control of American waters, the British enjoy this 
freedom of movement. If another power gains control of 
American waters, then the British are bound by the limita­
tions on movement that usually apply to the Americans, 
while the Americans enjoy the freedom of movement that 
usually applies to the British. 

Diplomacy 

Because of the tremendous economic and military strength 
of Britain, the American revolutionaries should try to gar­
ner as much support from other European powers as possi­
ble. This is done during the Diplomacy phase. To gain sup­
port you must decide what terms you wish to pursue with 
each country and then deSignate your ambassadors. The 
politician deSignated as ambassador to a country will con­
tribute his negotiating talent to the diplomacy between the 
two countries. As with other political appointments, re­
gional and ideological balances of the appointees is critical. 

The big three European countries, France, Spain and Hol­
land can potentially playa key role in the American Revo­
lution, and other countries can contribute in smaller ways. 

FRANCE is the most important potential ally. It has the 
largest treasury, the largest army, and the largest fleet of all 
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the European powers. The chief rival of England since the 
1400s, France lost a world-wide colonial war to England in 
the middle of the 1700s and is looking for revenge. Howev­
er, its navy is quite inferior to the Royal Navy, so its poten­
tial value is limited unless it can combine with one or more 
of the other significant powers. 

SPAIN, once the world's greatest power, has fallen upon 
hard times. However, it still has a considerable army and, 
more important, a large fleet that, when combined with 
France's, creates a combined force that outnumbers Eng­
land's. Furthermore, like France, Spain has a grudge against 
Britain: Gibraltar, the British fortress on the Spanish coast 
that dominates the passage from the Atlantic Ocean to the 
Mediterranean Sea. 

HOLLAND was also once a great power, but has fallen into 
the ranks of the secondary powers as well. Nevertheless, it 
is a rich country with a consequential navy that can offer 
limited support of real value. Like the others, it dislikes Brit­
ain. Its complaint is that British efforts to keep military sup­
plies from America interfere with freedom of commercial 
navigation, vital for the mercantile Dutch economy. Hol­
land cannot defeat Britain by itself, but it can be a signifi­
cant addition to an anti-British coalition. 

In addition to these potentially major players, there are a 
number of other powers of lesser potential significance. 
You cannot approach them directly, but instead can desig­
nate a single ambassador to work "at large," to see what he 
can come up with. The main secondary powers are Europe­
an "public opinion," the British opposition, Prussia, and 
Russia, grouped together under the name Others for the 
purposes of the game. If the ambassador makes a favorable 
impression abroad, "Friends of Liberty" at courts every­
where will support the Americans, which can help their di­
plomacy. If the ambassador can make contact with the Brit­
ish opposition, he may be able to help them move a block 
of a dozen or two votes in Commons away from the gov­
ernment. Prussia has no navy to speak of and has tradition­
ally allied with England, but its king, Frederick the Great, 
aspires to leadership in Germany, and dislikes the practice 



Revolution '76 

of the petty German princes of hiring out their soldiers as 
mercenaries. It is possible that he can be induced to inter­
vene diplomatically against any British attempts to recruit 
regiments from this source, which will otherwise very likely 
contribute a large number of troops to the British army. 
Queen Catherine the Great of Russia is looking for ways to 
extend her influence westwards, and will be happy to take 
advantage of Britain's discomfort to do so. Specifically, she 
may be induced to form a "League of Armed Neutrality" to 
protect freedom of navigation from British interference. 

PROPOSAL 
There are several levels of relations that can exist between 
each European power and the American government. To 
choose one, click on the circle under the name of a coun­
try, then click on the name of the proposed relationship. 
The icon symbolizing your choice will appear to the right 
of the circle; the icon on the left stands for the current level 
of relations between the country in question and the Amer­
icans. The relationships you can propose are: 

Covert Support: The government is helping the Ameri­
cans quietly, primarily by supplying arms. This limited sup­
port can be quite valuable, and because it is secret can be 
gained even before the Americans have declared their inde­
pendence. 

Overt Support: The government is helping the Americans 
openly. This help includes not only money and arms, but 
also the use of their ports as privateering bases. This overt 
support will only be extended when America has explicitly 
committed itself to independence. 

Co-Belligerency: Co-belligerency means that the other 
country has also gone to war against the British, but with­
out any specific agreement to cooperate with the Ameri­
cans. The power will help the revolutionaries with overt 
support, and by fighting the British elsewhere it will draw 
off considerable forces that would otherwise be available 
for service in America. The European powers will only risk 
co-belligerency if Britain appears to be strained by the war 
in America. 
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Alliance: The strongest form of support, an alliance means 
that the other country will supply financial backing, muni­
tions, and privateering bases, will undertake operations 
against England in Europe or other colonial areas, and, fi­
nally, will work directly with the Americans on both land 
and sea. An expeditionary force of some thousands of regu­
lars may be sent to serve with the Americans, and the coun­
try's navy will try to gain control of American waters. This 
level of cooperation will only be forthcoming if the Ameri­
cans appear to be winning the war. 

You will also have to assign an ambassador to negotiate 
with the British for an end to the war. In this case, your 
ambassador will propose peace terms. The possible terms, 
displayed at the bottom right of the screen, are: 

Pardons: All the Americans want is a promise that the 
participants in the revolution will not be tried for treason. 
Otherwise, they will accept British terms, which means the 
complete subordination of the colonies to Parliament and 
the King. This is a last ditch proposal that should be offered 
only if the alternative is total military defeat. 

Autonomy: This is the American position at the outset of 
the game, and represents the conditions most Americans 
originally hoped to achieve. In this case, the Americans re­
main colonial subjects of the British crown, but the British 
grant them a privileged place within the Empire, with ex­
tensive rights to self-government. 

Independence: The Americans will no longer accept their 
ties to the British Empire; now they insist on British recog­
nition of their place among the independent nations. The 
thirteen colonies will cease to be colonies, and will take 
their place as the United States among the independent na­
tions of the world. The British army will evacuate all posi­
tions remaining within its borders. 

Expansion: The Americans want not just independence, 
but control of North America, including Canada and all ter­
ritories west of the Mississippi. This represents the maxi­
mum possible victory for the Americans, a total success. 
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DISPATCH AMBASSADORS: Once you've set your terms 
you have to assign representatives to try to obtain them. 
You do this by clicking on the Go On box, which brings up 
the Dispatch Ambassadors screen. This screen looks exactly 
like the Assign Leaders screen, except that the icons at the 
bottom of the screen indicate countries instead of commit­
tee assignments. The selection process proceeds in the same 
way, and your concerns should be similar: choosing men of 
strong negotiating ability (especially for France, Spain and 
Britain, the most critical posts) and balancing the different 
regions and factions. 

There are two ways that the game can end: 
MILITARY VICTORY 
One side or the other has won control over all five regions 
and six cities of North America. 

NEGOTIATED SETTLEMENT 
The two sides have agreed on terms during the Diplomacy 
phase. In this case, the war, and the game, end because the 
two sides have agreed on a basis for peace. This outcome 
occurs if the British proposal is the same as, or more favora­
ble to the Americans than the American proposal. The final 
result when this happens will be peace on the basis of the 
American proposal. 

For example, if the Americans send an ambassador seeking 
autonomy, and the British have decided that they should 
offer autonomy, then the game will end on the basis of au­
tonomy. On the other hand, if the Americans send an am­
bassador seeking autonomy, but the British have decided to 
offer independence, then the game ends on the basis of au­
tonomy. This negotiating process has two implications that 
should be kept in mind. First, if you offer mild terms you 
may find that the British accept, precluding the possibility 
of achieving a higher level of victory. Secondly, if you offer 
terms that are less favorable to the Americans than the Brit­
ish are ready to accept, you will have robbed the Americans 
of the full fruits of their success. 

Of course, if you set the Americans' terms too high you 
may lose the opportunity to win a favorable peace, and 
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may find the game ending with the Americans in a worse 
position than before. 

If either of the above conditions has been fulfilled, the pro­
gram will then proceed with the game end sequence, in 
which victory will be determined and the winner an­
nounced. 

Levels of Victory 
There are five levels of victory on which the game can end. 
They are covered in detail on page 40 - 41. Basically, it is a 
negotiated settlement of the terms that you offered to the 
British. 

Surrender: The player cannot propose this level because it 
represents the total defeat of the American cause: the colo­
nies will be placed under British control and the leaders of 
the rebellion will be tried and executed for treason. The 
British may demand this result, but the only way they can 
impose it is through a total military victory. 

Pardons: This result leaves the American colonies in the 
same position as surrender, but guarantees the personal, if 
not political safety of the leading rebels. 

Autonomy: The Americans have won a hollow victory. 
The colonies are still part of the British Empire, and have 
not really changed their status from the beginning of the 
revolution. 

Independence: The Americans have won complete inde­
pendence. The United States of America stands as a sove­
reign nation, and are no longer colonies. This is result is 
the equivalent of the actual historical result. 

Expansion: The Americans win independance, plus con­
trol of lands beyond the original thirteen colonies. The 
United States may have annexed lands in all of North 
America, including Canada, and territories east of the Mis­
sissippi. This represents a total victory for the rebels. 
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VICTORY EVALUATION 
If the player achieves independence or expansion, his per­
formance will be further rated on how well this has been 
done. The criteria are: the level of victory won, the number 
of years it took, the number of regions and cities con­
trolled, the levels of patriotism and loyalism, the level of 
government organization, the shape the economy is in, the 
level of foreign support, and the number of diplomatic 
promises broken. A final, overall rating is then given. The 
possible levels are: 

• Poor • Good 
• Fair • Excellent 
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Organization 
Information 
Display 

Game Reference Section 

INFORMATION DISPLAYS 

The information displays are accessible at all times during 
play, and contain overview information about the U.S. 
GOVERNMENT, the five REGIONS, thirteen STATES, six 
CITIES, foreign COUNTRIES with which the Americans 
have or would like to have relations (as well as Britain, 
whose relationship to America the revolutionaries would 
like to change), the ARMIES in each region and each city, 
American GENERALS and POLITICIANS, and British GEN­
ERALS. All can be reached by clicking on the Info menu, 
holding the mouse button down, highlighting your choice, 
and then releasing. The information available is described 
in detail below. 

Government 

CO .. J I".'" r Al ,.OUI R"Hf .. 1 

SOU!'I t'lqn Sldtu,: 
019anllittlOn: 

Confed!'t <lllon Uol .. . : 

Rt'll t !' s pnldllon: 
T aXoltlon: 
\.Je ~ tet n I M.d·: 

Describes the ORGANIZATION, FINANCES, ARMY and 
NAVY status and FOREIGN RELATIONS situation of the re­
bellious American government. 

ORGANIZATION 
• Sovereign Status: Whether the thirteen colonies are : 
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Colonial: which means that they have neither declared in­
dependence during the Organization phase nor gone be­
yond requesting recognition of their Autonomy within the 
British Empire in the Diplomacy phase; 

Adrift: which means that they have been declared /lin re­
bellion" by His Majesty's government; or 

Independent: which means that they have declared inde­
pendence from Great Britain. 

• Government Organization: Whether the continental gov­
ernment consists of: 

Congress: a body of representatives of thirteen autono­
mous colonies/states; 

Confederation: meaning the thirteen states have formally 
united and empowered Congress to act as their common 
government; or 

Executive: meaning the congress has created permanent 
executive departments to replace its standing committees. 

• Confederation Votes: The number of states that have vot­
ed in favor of confederation. 

• Representation: The basis for allocating the number of 
votes in the congress. The three possibilities are: 

By State: each state has one vote. This is the basis that is 
in effect at the beginning of play. 

Proportional: each state has a number of votes that re­
flects the proportion of its population in the total popula­
tion of the United States. 

Bicameral: the congress consists of two chambers, one of 
which is based on a fixed, equal representation of states, 
while the other is based on proportional representation. 
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• Taxation: The method by which the continental govern­
ment can raise funds. The two possible ways are: 

Supported By States: The continental government has 
no authority to levy taxes, and must rely on contributions 
from the state governments. In the game, if this is the tax 
system in force the player's tax levies will be modified by 
each region according to its willingness to pay. This is the 
method that is in effect at the beginning of the game. 

Federal Taxation: The continental government can raise 
money itself by levying taxes. In the game, if the govern­
ment has this power, the level of taxation the player levies 
is the level that will be collected. 

• Western Lands: The status of the extensive and often 
competing claims to lands beyond the Appalachian Moun­
tains based on colonial charters held by various states. The 
two alternatives are: 

State Claims: As the game begins, the existing states have 
claims to most of the lands east of the Mississippi, which 
only need adjusting by the central government to reconcile 
competing claims to the same territories. 

Federal Ownership: Most of the lands beyond the Appa­
lachians will be ceded to the continental government, to be 
administered by that body until they are settled enough to 
form new states. 

• Slaves: The extent to which black slaves will be counted 
in apportioning taxes and, if appropriate, votes in the Con­
tinental Congress. They can be: 

Not Counted: The slaves will not be counted at all, since 
they are considered the property of their owners and have 
no independent political standing within the slaveholding 
states; 

Fully Counted: The slaves will be counted equally with 
freemen, since they are inhabitants of the states whose in­
terests will be affected by continental decisions; or 
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Partially Counted: Five slaves will be arbitrarily given 
the value of three freemen in terms of taxation and repre­
sentation. This is the system that was used by the Conti­
nental Congress to apportion taxes before the Articles of 
Confederation were drafted. 

FINANCES: Succinct description of the new government's 
economic health, including: 

• Finance Chairman/Secretary of the Treasury: The name of 
the leader currently serving as the head of the financial ad­
ministration of the continental government. The title is 
"Committee Chair" if the government's organization level 
is Congress or Confederation; it is "Treasury Secretary" if 
the level is Executive. 

• Income: The amount of money raised by the continental 
government so far during the current year, in thousands of 
dollars. 

• Spending: The total amount of money expended by the 
continental government so far this year. 

• Price Level: The extent to which prices are subject to in­
flation. Inflation is determined at the end of each year by 
dividing the total income by the total spending. Since the 
government has to print money to cover any gap between 
spending and income, after the first year or two the value 
of continental currency will fall by the amount of the ex­
cess printed. The value of currency is expressed by the ratio 
of face value to real value. At the beginning of the game, 
with no inflation, the ratio is 1/1. 

• Economic Policy: The economic reform effort currently in 
effect, if any. The possible reform efforts are: 

No Economic Policy: The government has a completely 
laissez faire attitude, letting the natural interplay of eco­
nomic forces determine the fate of the economy; 

Punish Profiteers: The government is attempting to curb 
price increases by prosecuting those who seek to profit 
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from inflation by raising their prices beyond the rise of 
their own expenses; 

Impose Price Controls: In order to control the rise in 
costs, the government is setting the selling price for goods 
and services; 

Issue New Currency: Recognizing that public confidence 
in, and hence the value of, continental money has dropped 
irreparably, the government has issued a new paper money 
to serve as legal tender. People holding the older currency 
can exchange it for new money at a predetermined rate, 
but because several old dollars will be needed to get one 
new dollar, this measure amounts to a partial repudiation 
by the government of its debt. 

Repudiate Debt: Recognizing that it will never be able to 
honor all its obligations, the government has declared that 
it will not even try to repay its debts. 

ARMY: How things are faring with the continental land 
forces. 

• War Chairman/Secretary of War: Names the current lead­
er in charge of military affairs, with the exact title reflecting 
whether or not the government has organized an executive 
branch. 

• Total Continentals: The total number of continental regu­
lar soldiers (militia are not counted). 

• Supply Level: The current level of support being supplied 
the continental armed forces. 

• Supply Costs: The total dollar cost of supplying the cur­
rent level of supply to the current total of continentals. 

• Prestige: The reputation of the continental army, which 
reflects its record of victories and defeats against British reg­
ulars. The possible levels are: 
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Despised: The continentals are considered a joke; 

Questioned: The value of the continental army is in 
doubt, either because it has not yet fought or because its 
record is not very good; 

Respected: The continentals have acquitted themselves 
fairly well on the battlefield, and are therefore regarded as a 
serious challenge to the Redcoats; 

Feared: The continentals are so successful that they are 
clearly equal to their British opponents. 

NAVY: The military situation on the high seas. 
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• Navy Chairman/Secretary of the Navy: The leader current­
ly responsible for the continental navy. 

• Total Frigates: The total number of frigates in the navy. 
This does not include privateers or ships under construc­
tion. 

• Construction Capacity: The potential number of frigates 
that could be built at once by all the ports controlled by 
the Americans. 

• Building Program: The level of shipbuilding activity cur­
rently being undertaken by the continental government. 

• Under Construction: The number of frigates currently be­
ing built for the American navy. 

• Naval Costs: The cost of the current fleet and building 
program given the nation's construction capacity. 

FOREIGN RELATIONS: The current state of the Ameri­
cans' relations with both the Crown and with actual or po­
tential allies. 

• Foreign Relations Chairman/Secretary of State: The leader 
currently in charge of administering relations between the 
revolutionary government and other countries. 
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• u.s. Peace Terms: The continental government's current 
proposal for America's relationship to Great Britain. The 
possibilities are: 

Pardons: The thirteen colonies will accept a subordinate 
role in the British Empire in return for amnesty for all 
Americans who participated in revolutionary activities; 

Autonomy: The thirteen colonies will remain part of the 
British Empire, but will be responsible for their own inter­
nal administration, free from interference by Parliament, 
and guaranteed the same protections from royal power en­
joyed by Englishmen; 

Independence: The British government will recognize the 
independence of the former colonies and their union as the 
United States of America. 

Expansion: The British government will not only recog­
nize the independence and union of its former colonies, 
but will cede to it Canada and/or extensive tracts in the 
Ohio Valley and Great Lakes region. 

• France, Spain, Holland: Gives the current level of rela­
tions between the United States and the named govern­
ment. The possible levels are: 

No Ties: The two governments have no relationship 

Covert Support: The government named is secretly sup­
porting the revolution, primarily with money and arms; 

Overt Support: The government is openly supporting the 
United States: it has recognized its government, is supply­
ing money and weapons, and will allow American priva­
teers to use its harbors; 

Co-Belligerency: The other country is at war with Britain 
as well, although it and the United States are not formally 
allied. The ties are all those of Overt Support, and the coun­
try ties down significant British military and naval resourc­
es that would otherwise be free to fight in America. 
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Alliance: The United States and the country named have a 
formal military alliance. This has all the benefits of Co­
Belligerency, and the foreign nation also supplies some reg­
ular soldiers directly to the fight in America. 

• Commitment: Each of the named countries may request a 
special commitment by the United States in exchange for a 
higher level of cooperation than it would be willing to give 
normally. The levels are: 

No Special Commitment: The United States has not ac­
cepted such a deal with the country named on the line 
above. 

Newfoundland to France: The United States has agreed 
not to make peace until Britain grants France control of the 
lucrative fisheries off Newfoundland. 

Gibraltar to Spain: The United States has agreed not to 
make peace until Britain returns Gibraltar to Spain. 

Neutral Shipping Guaranteed: The United States has 
agreed not to make peace until Britain guarantees the secur­
ity of neutral ships on the high seas from search and sei­
zure by belligerents during a war. 

REGIONS: These charts contain the following information 
about the five regions: NEW ENGLAND, MID-ATLANTIC, 
CHESAPEAKE, CAROLINAS, and CANADA: 

• States: Names the states that make up the region. 

• Cities: Names the major city or cities in the region that 
playa role in the game. 

• Population: Gives the total population of non-slaves in 
the region. 

• Slaves: Gives the total number of slaves in the region. 

• Tax Base: The total amount of wealth in the region. 
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• Tax Rate: The current level of taxation in the region. The 
possible levels are: 

Light: Tax levies amount to less than 1 % of the tax base; 

Moderate: Tax levies amount to between 1% and 5% of 
the tax base; 

High: Tax levies amount to between 5% and 10% of the 
tax base; 

Crisis: Tax levies amount to over 10% of the tax base. 

• Tax Returns: The exact amount returned by the current 
tax rate. It reflects not only the rate and the base, but also 
the patriotism of the region and the abilities of the Treasu­
ry Secretary or Finance Committee Chairman. 

• Militia Mobilization: Gives the mobilization level current­
ly in effect for the region. The possible mobilization levels 
are: 

Minimal: Virtually no militia are available for service 

Limited: Some militia are available; 

Extensil'e: Most potential militia are available for service; 

General: All possible militia have been recruited and are 
available for service. 

• Recruitment: Gives the recruitment effort to enlist new 
continental regulars currently in effect for the region. The 
possible recruitment policies are: 

Routine: No special effort is being made to recruit new 
continental regulars, although recruitment officers are ac­
tive and may enroll some new troops; 

Bonuses: Special enticements of land or money are being 
offered to induce men to enlist; 
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Quotas: Recruitment goals have been imposed which the 
states are expected to fill using a limited form of draft; 

Combined: In order to recruit maximum manpower into 
continental service, the government is offering both special 
enticements and imposing quotas for enlistments. 

• Tory Policy: The government's current policy toward Loy­
alists. Tory policies are: 

Condliatory: The government is actively minimizing the 
issues of independence and loyalty, and protecting suspect­
ed Tories from radical revolutionaries; 

Tolerant: The government has adopted a neutral attitude 
toward the Tories, neither courting nor combatting them; 

Prosecutory: The government is actively seeking to sup­
press loyalism within the structure of careful and deliberate 
legal actions; 

Persecutory: The government is hJ.rassing suspected To­
ries through all available means, usiag its legal powers and 
accepting and even promoting popular mob actions. 

• Patriotism: The level of active support for the revolution­
ary government. The levels include: 

None: support for the revolutionaries is practically non­
existent; 

Weak: Only a little support exists for the revolution; 

Strong: A good number of people actively support the rev­
olution; 

Solid: Supporters of the revolution are both numerous and 
active. 

• Loyalism: The level of active Sl.lpport for the British. The 
levels are the same as for patriotism given above, but indi­
cate the degree of opposition to the revolution. 
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STATES: Displays a map with information on each of the 
thirteen states (although of course they're not officially 
states until you declare independence). 

• Free Population. 

• Slaves. 

• Western Lands: Shows each state's claims to western 
lands, if any. 

• Confederation Vote: Shows whether the state voted "yea" 
or "nay" on the Articles of Confederation. 

CITIES: These boxes display relevant information for each 
of the six port cities that playa role in the game. 

• Population: If the city and the region it is in are con­
trolled by different sides, then the total population of the 
region will be reduced accordingly. 

• Tax Base: The amount of wealth contained in the city. If 
the city and the region are controlled by opposite sides, the 
tax base of the region will be reduced accordingly. 

• Port: The nature of the city's port, which determines its 
potential for ship construction, the number of privateers 
that can operate from it, its economic importance, and its 
attractiveness to the British for use as a base. The different 
types of port are: 

Major Port: The city has a large port that makes it a vital 
economic center, a strong naval base, and an attractive base 
for the British. 

Minor Port: The city's port is of limited capacity, making 
it of limited economic importance and strategic interest. 

• Privateer Potential: The maximum number of ships that 
can sail from the port to prey upon British shipping. 



Revolution '76 

• Active Privateers: The number of ships from the city actu­
ally engaged in privateering. 

• Shipbuilding Capacity: The maximum number of frigates 
that can be constructed per year at the port. 

55 

• Fortifications: The significance of fortifications for any de­
fense of the city. The possible sizes are: 

No Fort: The city has no significant fortifications; 

Minor Fort: The city has only limited fortifications; 

Major Fort: The city has extensive fortifications; 

World Class Fort: The city is heavily fortified and has 
natural features that make it even stronger. 

• Control: Identifies the Side, American or British, that cur­
rently has military control of the city. 

COUNTRIES: This chart gives statistics onBRIT AIN, 
FRANCE, SPAIN, HOLLAND and OTHERS, the latter being a 
catch-all for various European countries that could have 
helped the Americans. The information on Britain is slight­
ly different than that on the other countries since Ameri­
ca's relationship with Britain was quite different from its re­
lationship to the others-precisely the opposite, in fact. 

BRITAIN 
• Population: The total population of the British Isles. 

• American Policy: The peace terms presently proposed by 
the British government. They include all of the terms that 
can be proposed by the player, plus an additional one: Sur­
render. Surrender, the British policy at the start of the 
game, simply means that the Americans should lay down 
their arms and submit to the lawful authority of His Majes­
ty's government. 

• Government: The political party backed by a majority of 
the members of Parliament. The two parties are: 
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The Tory Party: Not connected to the Tory faction in 
America, the Tory Party is the governing party at the begin­
ning of the revolution. It is committed to keep the Ameri­
can colonies in the Empire, even if this means war. 

The Whig Party: The opposition party at the beginning 
of the revolution, the Whigs were persistent critics of the 
Tory's American policy. Sympathetic to the Americans' pro­
tests, they favored leniency before war broke out and peace 
once it had started, even if this meant granting the Ameri­
can independence. 

• Government Majority: The number of votes more than 
the opposition that the government party controls. The 
stronger the support for the government is, the larger its 
majority. As this majority shrinks, the government be­
comes weaker until, if it drops below I, the government 
falls and the opposition forms a new government. In a 
sense, this is the most critical indicator for the revolution­
aries; if the Tory government loses its majority and the 
Whigs take over, it is almost certain that the British will 
recognize American independence. 

• Government Revenues: The total income of the British 
government. 

• Total Army: The total number of troops available for de­
ployment around the world. Because of British interests 
elsewhere, only a fraction of these can be sent against 
America, but this is a measure of British power vis-a-vis the 
European states. 

• Troops for America: From Britain's total army, the num­
ber of troops stationed in Britain actually available for ser­
vice in America in the coming year. 

• Ships of the Line: The total number of ships of the line in 
the Royal Navy. These were the capital ships of the era, 
equivalent to aircraft carriers today or battleships in World 
War I, and they were far stronger than the light frigates the 
Americans could build. The Royal Navy thus enjoyed total 
superiority over the Americans. However, the French, 
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Spanish, and Dutch did have sizable numbers of ships of 
the line, and in a coalition could challenge British control 
of the sea lanes. Thus, a country's number of ships of the 
line is an important measure of its international power. 
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• Ships in America: The number of British ships of the line 
stationed in America. It serves as both a general indicator of 
the strength of the British naval forces deployed against the 
Americans and as the naval power that any European na­
tion allied with America must beat in order to seize control 
of American waters from the British. 

FRANCE, SPAIN, HOLLAND, OTHERS 
• American Policy: The current level of relationship sought 
by the country. 

• Government Revenue: The total income of the nation's 
government. Only a fraction of this is available for military 
activities, but it is a good overall indicator of a country's 
war-making potential. 

• Subsidy to U.S.: The amount of money being paid by this 
country to the American rebels as a grant or as a loan. Sub­
sidies will be granted in ascending amounts as part of Overt 
Support, Co-belligerency, and Alliance. 

• Total Army: The total number of land troops deployed by 
the country's armed forces. In all cases, these face signifi­
cant threats from other European land powers, so only a 
fraction are available for overseas duty, but this is the most 
basic measure of a country's power. 

• Troops to America: The number of troops available as re­
inforcements for the continental army. Only countries ac­
tually allied to America will have any troops for America; 
co-belligerents will contribute to the land war only indi­
rectly, by drawing off British reinforcements that would 
otherwise be sent to America. 

• Ships of the Line: The number of capital ships in the 
country's navy. An overall indicator of the country's mili­
tary strength. 
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• Ships of the Line in America: The number of ships of the 
line actually stationed in American waters. Only countries 
allied with America will have ships of the line in America . 

ARMIES: Displays the American and British military situa­
tion in the five American regions and six cities. 

• General (American)/Commander (British): A leader's abili­
ties affect the army's losses due to desertions, its likelihood 
of staging a mutiny, and its performance in combat. Gener­
als are necessary in order to move a force of regulars from 
one area to another during the campaign phase. 

• Regulars: The number of fully trained, full-time soldiers 
on each side in the area. Only regulars can move with a 
general from one area to another. 

• Militia/Tories: The number of part-time soldiers available 
to each side in the area. Militia are the irregular forces of 
the revolutionaries; Tories are the local Loyalists who fight 
for the British. Neither militia nor Tories can move from 
one area to another, although the British may recruit some 
Loyalists into their regular forces during the recruitment 
phase. 

• Morale: The attitude of the soldiers . Victories and/or plen­
tiful supplies will raise morale; defeats and/or deprivation 
will decrease it. Morale affects the army's desertion rate and 
its performance in battle. 

• American Supply: Gives the supply level of the American 
army, an important determinant of a force's power. 

• Fort: If the area is a city, the value of the fort will be dis­
played under the forces occupying it . 

• American Training: The level of training the military has. 
This is a very important factor in battle. 

AMERICAN GENERALS: These are the dossiers on the 
American leaders who are available to command the revo­
lutionary armies. 
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• Name. 

• Home State: Where a general is from is important politi­
cally, for each region jealously monitors the regional bal­
ance among the revolutionary leadership, and patriotism 
will decline in a region that feels slighted. 

• Popularity: Appointing a popular general will increase 
support for the revolution, and will thereby offset the ef­
fects of regional loyalties to some extent. The levels of pop­
ularity are: 

Unknown: The general has no reputation, and his ap­
pointment will have no special political effect; 

Disgraced : The general has suffered a humiliating defeat, 
and his appointment will be taken as a sign of desperation, 
decreasing support of the revolution; 

Acceptable: The general is widely known, but does not in­
spire a strong reaction one way or another; 

Popular: The general is well known and is well regarded. 
His appointment will be politically beneficial. Conversely, 
replacement of a popular general will reduce patriotism, 
unless his replacement is of equal or higher status. 
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A Hero: The general is universally acclaimed. Appointment 
will inspire much confidence; replacement will be poorly 
received. 

• Generalship: The general's military skill. The higher the 
skill, the betler his troops will perform on the battlefield. 

• Leadership: The general's ability to inspire the confidence 
of his troops. The higher the leadership, the less the army 
will be plagued by desertions and mutinies. 

• Command: The area in which the general is currently in 
command of friendly forces. 
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• Orders: The general's current orders, if any. The possible 
orders are: 

Move: The general is leading a group of regulars from one 
area to another, taking command of all regulars and militia 
in the destination area if so ordered; 

Defend : The general is taking command of the regulars 
and militia already present in an area. 

• Origin: The area from which the general is moving an 
army if his orders are to move. 

• Destination: The area into which the general is to lead his 
forces if his orders are to move, or the area he is to lead the 
defense of, if his orders are to defend. 

• Troops: The number of regulars that a General ordered to 
move has under his command during movement. 

POLITICIANS: These displays contain information about 
the leaders available to fill political posts in the revolution­
ary movement. 

• Home State: Where a politician comes from is important, 
since each region wants to make sure that it gets as strong a 
representation as possible, and will become alienated from 
the revolutionary cause if it is too badly underrepresented. 

• Faction: In addition to geographic divisions, the strength 
of the revolutionary movement is affected by the balance 
of the ideological factions within it. The two factions are: 

Radicals : The strongly revolutionary patriots, who are de­
termined to break away from Britain. They are particularly 
strong in New England and the Chesapeake regions. 

Moderates: The more cautious patriots, who oppose Brit­
ish policies but are reluctant to end the political ties to Brit­
ain. They are particularly strong in the Middle States and 
the Carolinas. 
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• Administrative Talent: The leader's ability to manage the 
day-to-day affairs of a department of the government. The 
higher the ability, the better the results of activities under 
his supervision. 
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• Negotiating Talent: The leader's ability to persuade others 
to a point of view or course of action. The higher the abili­
ty, the more likely foreign governments to which the leader 
is ambassador will agree to American proposals. 

• Current Service: The type of position the leader currently 
holds. The possible types are: 

Congress: The leader has no special position currently; 

Committee Chair/Executil'e: The leader currently serves 
as head of one of the administrative branches of govern­
ment: finance, army, navy, or foreign affairs. The difference 
between Committee Chair and Executive reflects the coun­
try's organizational level: leaders are chairmen of congres­
sional committees unless an Executive has been created. 

Ambassador: The leader is currently representing the 
United States to a foreign country, either to negotiate peace 
(with Britain) or to seek support for the American cause 
(from France, Spain, Holland, or Others). 

• Assignment: The politician's specific assignment. 

Treasury: The leader supervises the collection of taxes; 

Arm,,: The leader supervises recruitment of troops and pro­
vision of supplies; 

NallY: The leader supervises the building of ships and the 
activities of the active navy; 

Foreign/State: The leader supervises relations with all oth­
er countries; 

Ambassador: Negotiates relations with the specific coun­
try to he has been sent. 
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BRITISH GENERALS: Dossiers giving information about 
the generals who could potentially lead forces against the 
revolutionary armies. 

• Seniority: The order in which generals will be picked to 
command. 

• Status: The regard in which a general is held. The possible 
levels are the same as for the American generals. 

• Generalship: The general's military skill. You will want to 
keep an eye on this to make sure that there are no serious 
mis-matches between your generals and their British adver­
saries. 

• Command: The area in which the general is currently in 
command of forces. 

• Orders: The general's current orders. The possible orders 
are: 

Move: The general is leading a group of regulars from one 
area to another, taking command of all regulars and Tories 
in the destination area. 

Defend: The general is taking command of the regulars 
and Tories already present in an area. 

• Origin: The area from which the general is to move an 
army if his orders are to move. 

• Destination: The area into which the General is to lead 
his forces if his orders are to move, or the area he is to lead 
the defense of, if his orders are to defend. 

• Troops: The number of regulars that a general ordered to 
move has under his command during movement. 
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In general, remember that the revolution was a war, but it 
was much more than just a war. It was a political struggle 
within the American population; it was a diplomatic con­
test played out, on a world scale; it was an economic chal­
lenge to both America and Britain; and, in the end, it was a 
battle of nerves between two groups of men, each deter­
mined to prevail, but each tied to other groups less com­
mitted and less determined. You must strive to keep all 
these elements in balance as you play: to gain military vic­
tories, to be sure, but also to cultivate alliances, to maintain 
the nation's economic health, and to forge the institutions 
of the world's first democracy. It is not necessary to win all 
the battles; in fact it is unlikely that you can. But if you 
play your cards right, the British will gradually lose heart 
anyway and recognize America's independence. On the 
other hand, if you do not manage all aspects of the struggle 
carefully, the American rebellion will join the crowded 
ranks of popular uprisings crushed by imperial powers. 

PHASES 

ASSIGN LEADERS: The first activity of the game, forming 
the government, is crucial to success. The abilities of the 
administrators will impact most undertakings of their 
branch of government: costs, performance, and the proba­
bility of success. Therefore, it is important to pick leaders 
with high administration ratings (although remember that 
the Treasurer will have to negotiate with the states to get 
taxes). On the other hand, all factions of patriots, both re­
gional and ideological, will want a fair representation in 
the government, so your appointments cannot disregard 
this political pressure. Technical proficiency will do you lit­
tle good if you alienate significant groups from the revolu­
tionary cause. 

Administer 

TAXATION: During the revolution it turned out that the 
Americans were almost as resistant to taxation with repre­
sentation as they were to taxation without it. In the first 
years you will undoubtedly be frustrated by the regions' 
reluctance to levy taxes, but just be patient. As time passes, 
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they will be more forthcoming, assuming that their patriot­
ism is high and you have a persuasive Finance Chairman. 

TORY POLICY: How you treat the Tories (those remain­
ing loyal to the King) will have a big impact on how well 
you do. You must know when and how to treat them. You 
will learn this through experience, but keep in mind that 
they are very conscious of how their local support stacks up 
against yours. If they are strong and the patriots are weak, 
then being too forceful can backfire. Conversely, if the loy­
alists are very weak and the patriots very strong, then crack­
ing down may make them into the underdogs. The time to 
crack down is when the two sides are about equal. 

Recruit 

The key to recruitment is a three-way balance between the 
privateers, the militia, and the regulars. It is easiest to re­
cruit privateers, because of the lure of the booty, but there 
is a natural limit to how many privateers can put to sea. 
Otherwise, men are readier to serve in the militia than in 
the regulars, because they can stay at home, attend to busi­
ness, and avoid the privation and danger of active service. 
In order to tempt significant numbers into regular service, 
you must either offer bonuses (expensive) or impose quotas 
(unpopular). Using both is most effective, but it has the dis­
advantages of both as well. 

What recruitment policies you set should reflect the man­
power needs you will have this year in the region. Regulars 
are most effective in combat, and can be moved from re­
gion to region, but they are expensive to recruit and sup­
ply. You should recruit them in regions you fear will be ma­
jor targets of the British, regions that are adjacent to such 
regions, or regions from which you expect to launch an of­
fensive against a British-controlled area. 

Militia are less powerful than regulars and can't move from 
area to area, but they don't cost you anything to raise or 
maintain. Therefore, they should be raised wherever you 
expect a British attack. Also a militia may deter a British 
move-remember, an area left undefended invites attack. 
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Privateers playa vital role in the game by eroding support 
for the war in Parliament. You will not see the results im­
mediately, but several years of raids on the British mer­
chant marine will begin to tell. You should be sure to en­
courage privateers whenever you do not need the 
manpower for more pressing business. 

Supply 

ARMY: In general, the more supplies the better your army 
will fight; if it goes too long on meager rations it will mu­
tiny. However, there are two countervailing factors. One is 
availability: Much military equipment must be procured 
overseas, and for that you will need diplomatic support. 
Second is cost: as the war drags on, you may find that the 
economic burden is greater than the military danger, and 
deliberately reduce your supply level to keep the country 
solvent. 
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NAVY BUILDING: The Americans did not have the 
knowledge or the funds to build ships of the line, the bat­
tleships of the eighteenth century that determined who 
controlled the seas. The best they could do was frigates, 
smaller, more lightly armed, but also more sprightly ships 
that served fleets as scouts and messengers, and served the 
Americans as exalted privateers. However, they did have an 
effect on morale: victories against British warships, albeit 
against other frigates the Royal Navy itself scarcely count­
ed, raised patriotism while at the same time eroding British 
confidence. Frigates are expensive, but they can also deliver 
a needed shot in the arm to American morale when other 
aspects of the war are going poorly. 

Campaign 

Military success is vital to the success of the revolution. The 
mechanics of the campaign phase are a bit more involved 
than those of other phases, but are easily mastered with a 
little practice. 

The two main issues of the campaign phase are: the politi­
cal pressure to defend threatened areas or regain occupied 
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areas versus the manifest military superiority of the British; 
and the importance of good leadership versus both the po­
litical pressure to maintain regional balance and the indi­
vidual ambitions of the generals. 

In the first case, you will pay a stiff price in support of the 
rebellion if you abandon areas to the British, but you also 
pay a price for loosing battles. A defeat in the open can usu­
ally be survived, for most American generals are able to re­
treat with at least a few troops, but they all will be lost if 
trapped in a city. Even so, you may have to sacrifice a force 
to avoid a crippling loss of face. 

In the second case, you must make similar trade-offs be­
tween talent and politics in assigning generals as in form­
ing a government. In addition, generals have ambitions 
which you must not frustrate. Pay attention to their pro­
tests when you replace them: the more they say, the more 
danger they pose to the rebellion. 

A useful tip is to remember that whenever regulars move 
into a British-held area, at least some local militia will rise 
to support them. They can be an important adjunct to a de­
termined force of regulars, and even 1,000 regulars can 
thereby cause some real damage to the British. 

Overall, the British are strong, but do not have unlimited 
resources. Their biggest threat will be in the first couple of 
years after 1775; if they are going to win militarily, they 
must do so then. If the war drags on, they may still win, 
but it will rather be because they outlast you economically 
and politically. Initially, you should concentrate on survi­
val, and later on attrition: in the end, time is on your side, 
especially if you can get help from your friends abroad. 

Diplomacy 

With EUROPEAN COUNTRIES: You need help. You 
need greater supplies and you need for British troops to be 
tied down in other parts of the world. You can also use ex­
tra money, bases for your privateers in European waters 
that are closer to the merchant shipping on which they 
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prey, and you can certainly use a few thousand extra regu­
lars. lf your allies gain control of the seas you may be able 
to deliver the coup de grace to a British force, and if you get 
really lucky the French and Spanish may get control of the 
English Channel and force the British to defend their 
homeland instead of reconquering America. 

How do you get this help? Be diplomatic. Put yourself in 
the other guy's shoes. Think how you'd feel in his place. 
Ask for too much and you'll get nothing. Ask for too little, 
and you may not get enough. It's a fine line. 
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Besides your general search for support, there are two issues 
in diplomacy. One is the "talent versus politics" issue in as­
signing ambassadors. The other is the issue of "entangling 
alliances." Should you accept help with strings attached, or 
hold out for unqualified support? On the one hand, you 
may need the help now, and your pride won't help you if 
the British force you to your knees. On the other hand, if 
you do accept conditional help, you will be expected to live 
up to your commitments. lf you fail to maintain them in 
further negotiations you may lose the support you already 
have, and if you make peace when they are unfulfilled, you 
will be dunned in the evaluation of your Victory level. 

With BRITAIN: You want America to gain independence, 
but a large segment of the American population does not 
share that ambition yet. lf you bull ahead, you will frighten 
them into support of the King. In the first year or two of 
the game, you must approach the British with one eye on 
your the moderates. Only if they are convinced of the futil­
ity of compromise will they support a revolution. 

Once the break is made, expect little from the Tory leaders 
in England (these Tories are a political party, not the 
"Tory" Americans who remain loyal to the King) . In Eng­
lish politics, a party stands and falls on its poliCies, and the 
Tory policy is to crush the rebellion. Unless it is faced by a 
critical military situation in Europe, it will adhere to this 
policy as long as it has a majority of votes in Parliament. 
If the government's majority disappears, the Whigs will 
come to power pledged to make peace. You will find them 
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much more amenable to negotiations, particularly if the 
military situation in Europe or the West Indies is against 
them. If you are feeling particularly strong, you may want 
to draw out the negotiations to get more favorable terms. 
But beware: they may fall from power in their turn, and 
you will be faced with the old Tory coalition. 

Organize Government: Starting in the second year you 
will need to decide what governmental activity will get the 
bulk of your attention each year. You will first get a series 
of messages about the performance of your administrators 
in the last year. You must decide which you will believe. If 
you accept them, you must then decide if matters are seri­
ous enough to warrant another year of basic organization. 
More likely, you will want to begin improving the govern­
ment, first by formally separating it from Britain, and later 
by creating permanent institutions: Articles of Confedera­
tion and an executive branch. Meanwhile, though, you 
may have to delay one or the other, either to reassign lead­
ers or reform the economy. 

DECLARE INDEPENDENCE: If you have laid the ground­
work in the previous year's diplomacy, you should be able 
to declare independence with the broad support of the pa­
triot coalition. It will set the stage for increased diplomatic 
support, and will enhance your popularity all around. 

CONFEDERATE: Once America is independent, it will 
need a permanent government to replace the ad hoc regime 
of the Second Continental Congress. However, four major 
issues must be resolved in order to bring the diverse states 
together: 

• Taxation: Should the states collect the taxes and support 
the federal government with contributions, or should the 
federal administration have its own sources of revenue? If 
you can get federal taxes, your money problems will be re­
duced significantly (although not altogether). Unfortunate­
ly, none of the states has any reason to support such an ar­
rangement. 

• Representation: Should the states be represented equally, 
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each having one vote in Congress, or should they be repre­
sented in proportion to the size of their populations? Natu­
rally, the large states favor the latter, while the small states 
favor the former. There is a third way: have two chambers 
of government, one with proportional, and the other with 
equal, representation. But this approach represents consid­
erably greater expense. Is it a golden compromise, or will 
you lose support from all states? 

• Western Lands: Keep in mind that only some states have 
them, and among those, some have much more than oth­
ers. How each state feels about this issue reflects whether 
they have interests there or not, and how important this is­
sue is to them depends on how much they have. 
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• Slave Representation: Slave states think slaves should be 
counted for purposes of political representation, while non­
slave states think they should not. It would appear that you 
can just count them, slave states versus non-slave states, 
and predict how they will feel. But, things aren't as simple 
as that. How much the issue matters will also depend on 
what form of representation you chose: if every state has 
one vote, political representation matters less than the eco­
nomic burden, whereas if representation is proportional, 
slave-holding states will value the extra voting power. Of 
course, there's always the possibility of counting the slaves 
partially, but as with the representation compromise, the 
question is whether both sides will accept partial satisfac­
tion or will both come away feeling wronged? 

CREATE EXECUTIVE: A strong executive will definitely 
give you better control over the revolutionary movement. 
However, the more radical patriots fear that a strong execu­
tive will lead to dictatorship~Lay the groundwork of a clear­
ly defined governmental structure, and they will go along 
with you; cram it down their throats and they will turn 
against you. 

REFORM ECONOMY: In order to run the war effort, you 
will have to pay. Unfortunately, the only way for you to 
pay is to print the money you need as you need it, regard­
less of your actual income. The problem is, as that paper 
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money enters circulation, more bills will be available to bid 
for the relatively constant amount of real wealth in the 
economy, and so the value of each dollar bill will decline. 
At first this effect will be muted, because historically the co­
lonial economy was actually starved for currency. Take into 
account that the economy can initially absorb the addition­
al issue. However, after a year or two, prices will begin to 
rise, and may get out of control. You may be able to keep 
them under control by keeping spending low, taxes high, 
and getting payments in specie (coin) from abroad. Howev­
er, even with these, inflation may get out of control. If it 
does, it will hurt. 

As prices rise to the danger pOint, you will be warned. 
When the warning comes, take time to reform the econo­
my. How stringent your measures must be will depend on 
how bad inflation is. If you aim too low, you will not curb 
the upward spiral. If you aim too high, you will lose popu­
larity because of your draconian poliCies. In general, re­
member that price levels above 10 times their starting lev­
els are beginning to be a problem, that levels above 20 are 
definitely a problem, and that 30 or more represents a cri­
sis. If you hit 40, you'll know it. 




